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Description
This newly equipped and calmly located fl at is 
situated in Vienna‘s elegant old imperial quar-
ter, the 13th district. Due to the location, both 
the tranquillity of nature and the proximity to 
the city centre are given. This fl at is located on 
the 4th and last fl oor (without lift) of a residential 
building built in 1966. The 68 m² of living space 
are optimally divided into an anteroom (approx. 
10 m²), a storage room (approx. 1.7 m²), a spa-
cious bedroom (approx. 18.50 m²) with exit to 
the north-east facing terrace (approx. 13.50 m²), 
a eat-in kitchen (approx. 27 m²) with exit to the 
south-east facing balcony (approx. 8 m²), a ba-
throom with bathtub, washing machine connec-
tion and toilet. The fi rst-class furnishings include 
a fi tted kitchen, parquet fl oors and air conditio-
ning in the living room and bedroom. The fl at is 
in a good general condition and can be inhabi-
ted immediately. Tram line 62, bus line 8A, 56A/B 
and 58A/B can be reached within a few minutes 
walking distance.

Greatspot im Wiens 
elegantem, altem 
Kaiserviertel nahe 
Schönbrunn mit perfekter 
Stadtanbindung
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Living Space:
Balcony: 
Terrace:

Cellar:

    68 m²
      8 m²
 13,5 m²
      4 m²
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Map

Energy Certifi cate
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Kontakt 
    info@greatspot.at    info@greatspot.at


